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From Book 1: The first book in a major new series from #1 internationally bestselling author Lucinda Riley,
author of The Midnight Rose—hailed as “an extraordinary story [and] a complex, deeply engaging tale filled
with fascinating characters” (Library Journal).

Maia D’Apliese and her five sisters gather together at their childhood home, “Atlantis”—a fabulous,
secluded castle situated on the shores of Lake Geneva—having been told that their beloved father, who
adopted them all as babies, has died. Each sister is handed a tantalizing clue to her true heritage—a clue that
takes Maia across the world to a crumbling mansion in Rio de Janeiro, Brazil. Once there, she begins to put
together the pieces of her story.

Eighty years earlier in the Rio of the 1920s, Izabela Bonifacio’s father has aspirations for his daughter to
marry into the aristocracy. Meanwhile, architect Heitor da Silva Costa is devising plans for an enormous
statue, to be called Christ the Redeemer, and will soon travel to Paris to find the right sculptor to complete
his vision. Izabela—passionate and longing to see the world—convinces her father to allow her to
accompany him and his family to Europe before she is married. There, at Paul Landowski’s studio and in the
heady, vibrant cafes of Montparnasse, she meets ambitious young sculptor Laurent Brouilly, and knows at
once that her life will never be the same again.

In this sweeping, epic tale of love and loss—the first in a unique, spellbinding new series—Lucinda Riley
showcases her storytelling talents like never before.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Parrish:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book The Seven Sisters (2 Book Series) will
make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some
of you think which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they
might be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or ideal book with you?

Gary Stark:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This The Seven Sisters (2 Book Series) is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

Jerry Goble:

This The Seven Sisters (2 Book Series) is new way for you who has attention to look for some information
because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this The Seven Sisters (2 Book Series) can be the light
food for you personally because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone.
These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form.
People who think that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not
any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you.
So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.

Sandra Williams:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book and also novel and The Seven Sisters (2 Book Series) or perhaps others
sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel need to read more and
more. Science reserve was created for teacher or students especially. Those publications are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes The Seven
Sisters (2 Book Series) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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